BID TABULATION

COLUMBIA COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

BID NO. __ 2026-C Residential, Commercial, and industrial Solid Waste Services
DATE: __January 16, 2026
Addendums Issued 2
Republic Services Waste Pro Express Disposal
OPTION 1 OPTION 2 * OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 1 OPTION 2
With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts
lRegular Resident No.Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.15 $9.90 $11.60 $10.36, $19.26 $15.77 $19.26 $15.77
Backdoor Resident No Bid Ng Bid No Bid No Bid $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $7.50 $7.50 $7.50 $7.50
Second Pickup No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00
Yard Trash No Bid No.Bid No Bid No Bid $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $4.25 $4.25 $4.25 $4.25
Bulk Yard Debris No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $6.50 $6.50 $6.50 $6.50
Meridian Waste Adams Sanitation FCC Environmental
OPTION 1 OPTION.2 OPTION 1 QOPTION 2 OPTION L OPTION 2
With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts ‘With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts
[Regular Resident $13.38 $11.67 $13.38 ] $11.67 $13 75 $12.03 $13 75 $12.03 $22.42 $19.70 $21.58 $18.83
Backdoor Resident $28.38 $26.67 $28.38 $26.67 $13.75 $12.03 $13 75 $12.03 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00
Second Pickup No Bid No Bid No-Bid ‘No Bid $7.97 $7.97 $7.97 $7.97 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00
Yard Trash No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.35 $1.35 $1.35 $1.35 $5.93 $5.93 $5.84 $5.84
Bulk Yard Debris $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 ] $12.00 No Bid)| No Bid No Bid| No Bid $3.25 $3.25 $3.25 $3.25
Coastal Waste & Recycling
OPTION 1 OPTION 2
With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts

lar Resident $14.78 $14.00 $14.78 $14.00

Backdoor Resident $10.00 $10.00 $10:00 $10.00

Second Pickup $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00

Yard Trash $2.27 $2.27 $2:27 $2.27

Bulk Yard Debris $5.65 $5.65 _S5.65 P

Witness: / f //ﬂ}g,
\— 7 /




ATTACHMENT A
BID FORM

OPTION 1: Residential Solid Waste, Commercial Solid Waste, Industrial Solid Waste,Permanent Roll-Off Containers,
and Construction and Demolition Waste Temporary Roll-Off Containers

a. Curbside Service
b: Curbside Service with Contractor Supplied Carts

OPTION 1 include County services. See list Below.
Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

a. Curbside Service (Cost , ot o gt
Per Month) Monufs of Rcsule'ntlal Extended Cost
Service Units
Regular Resident $ 9.90 12 22,930 $2,725,45"7.60
Backdoor Resident $ 20.00 12 8 $  1,920.00
Second Pickup $ 25.00 12 22,930 $6,879,000.00
Yard Trash $ 1.00 12 22,930 $ 275,160.00
Bulk Yard Debris $ 0.50 12 22,930 $ 137,580.00
Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $ $10,019,117.60
Without 2nd Pickup Extended Cost $ 3,140,117.60
Company Name: ‘Waste Pro of Florida, Ine.
Residential Solid Waste Collection
Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost
b, Curbside Service With
Contractor Supplied Months of Residential | .
Carts (Cost Per Service Units Extended Cost
Month)
Regular Resident $ 11.15 12 22,930 $3,069,332.76
Backdoor Resident $ 20.00 12 8 3 1,920.00
Second Pickup ¥ 25,00 12 22,930 $6,879,000.00
Yard Trash $ 1.00 12 22,930 $ 275,160.00
Bulk Yard Debris $ 0.50 12 22,930 $ 137,580.00

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Colléetion WITH Carts
Without 2nd Pickup In Extended Cost

Waste Pro of Florida, Inc,

Company Name:

$ $10,362,992.76
$ 3,483,992.76
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OPTION 1

Conimercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

. _ 2 Times Per | 3 Times Per
| 1 Time Per Week Week Week
Small Commercial (cart g 20.00 [N/A N/A
séivice) ,
2 yard frontload container $ 6495 | $ 12990 | $ 19485
4 yard frontload container $ 12990 | §  259.80 | § 389.70
6 yard frontload ~eon_t~ainer $ 194851 $ 38970 | $§ 58455
8 yard frontload container $ 25980 | & 519.60 | § 77940
Company Name: ' Waste Pro of Florida, lIng.
OPTION 1
Industrial Solid Waste
Permarient Roll-Off Containers
Delivery/ Install Renﬁa! per PerPull | Disposal Per Ton Péjif cubic
N month yard
2 yard stationary compactor CIngluded Included | Included Inehuded N/A
40 yard receiver container $125/$5,000 $ 550001 § 27700 1§ 52.00 N/A
30 yard self-contained §125/85,000 $  550.00| $ 277.00 |$ 5200 /A
compactor
20 yard open top container | § 12500 | §  100.00| $ 277.00 |$ 5200 |8 560
30 yard open fop container | § 12500 | § 11000 § 27700 |$ 52,00 | s 5.60
40 yard open top container | § 12500 | % 12000 § 27700 |§ 52,00 | § 5.60_
Company Nanie: Waste Pro of Florida, Inc.
OPTION 1
Construction and Demolition Waste
Temporay Roll-Oftf'Containers
- . Disposal Per Per cubie
. Rent yy '

3 Delivery/Install Per month Pull Ton vard
20 yard open top container $ 12500 | $  100.00| § 277.00 | $ 5200 § 5.0
30 yard opén top C'O.nt;'_li:lle'l’ % 125001 § 11000 § 27700 $ 5200 % 5.60
40 yard open top container $ 125.00 | % 120001 § 277.00 | § 52001 § 5.60
Company Name: Waste Pro of Florida, Inc.
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OPTION 2: Residential Solid Waste and Commercial Solid Waste ONLY

a. Curbside Service

b: Curbside Service with Contractor Supplied Carts

Option 2 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

a. Cu rbside Service (Cost| Months of Residential Extended Cost

Per Month) Service Units ’
Regular Resident $ 10.36 12 22,930 [ $2,850,455.08
Backdoor Resident $ 20.00 12 g1 §  1,920.00
Second Pickup $ 25.00 12 22,930 | $6,879,000.00
Yard Trash $ 1.00 12 22,9301 $ 275,160.00
Bulk Yard Debris $ 0.50 12 22,930 | $ 137,580.00

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Caris

Company Name:

OPTION 2

Without 2nd Pickup In

Waste Pro of Florida,

Extended Cost

Ine,

Moanthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

$10,144,115.08

$ 3,265,115.08

b. Curbside Service With Months of Residential Extended Cost
Contractor Supplied Service Units '
Regular Resident $ 11.60 12 22,9301 § 3,191,354
Backdoor Resident $ 20.00 12 81 $ 1,920
Second Pickup $ 25.00 12 22930 § 6,879,000
Yard Trash $ 1.00 12 22930 $ 275,160
Bulk Yard Debris $ 0.50 12 22,9301 $ 137,580
Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Colleetion WITH Carts $10,485,014.11
Without 2nd Pickup In Extended Cost $ 3,606,014.11
Company Name: Waste Pro of Florida, Inc.
OPTION 2
Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal
£ T o Do 2 Times Per | 3 Times Per
1 Time Per Week Week Week
qull Coznmerclal g 20.00 IN/A N/A
(cart service)
2 yard frontload container $ 6495 | § 12990 § 194.85
4 yard frontload container $ 12990 | § 259.80 ] $ 389.70
6 yard frontload container $ 194,85 | § 3890.70 | § 584.55
8 yard frontload container $ 259.80 | $ 519.60 | $§ 779.40
Company Name: Waste Pro of Florida, Inc, 28




COUNTY SERVICES

Cost per pickup X Pickups)per Week X Weeks of Service = Bxtended Cosl

Loeation Name Location Address Contnu.ler Cart C(ZSt Por Pickup (5) Por Week.s of Extended Cost
Size Pickup Week Service
Animal Enforcement C.R. 25A Trontload 8 yd. | § 28.00 1 52 $ 1,456.00
Animal Shelter 1392 NW Shelter Gln, | Trontload 8 yd. | § 28.00 2 52 $ 291200
Annie Matlox Park 537 NE Center Ave Trontload 8 yd. | § 28.00 ] 52 $  1,456.00
Bethlehem Community Center|835 SE Bethlehem Ave, | Frontload 8 yd. | § 28.00 1 52 $  1,456.00
Columbia County Emergency . " " .
. 263 NW Lake City Ave, | Frontload 6 yd, | § 21,00 2 52 $ 2,184.00

Operations Center
o umbia County Fire Station |sog gy Siate Road 247 [Trontload 4 yd, | 14.00 ! 52 5 72800
i;)zlumbm County Fire Station :7564 NW US Highway 96 gal Cart ¢ .00 I 59 § 364.00
Columbia County Fire Station {2318 SW Pinemount 96 gal Carl 4 7.00 | 52 $  364.00
#43 Hwy,

X .E. o stati 958§ S Hi i ; | v
Q)lumbl 1 County Fire Station 12595 8 US Highway 96 gal Cart g 7,00 : 5 g 364.00
#45 441
Foumbin County Fite SWOR lyos gy Dovich st [1rontload 2d. |$ 7,00 ! 52 § 36400
;’j;umbm County Fire Station 370 SE Race Track Ln, [Frontload 4 yd, | § 14,00 I 52 $ 728.00
Colmbia County Fire SN 1456 Nw Mershon St. (96 gal Cart~ [§ 7,00 I 52 § 36400

Y it ‘ire Statio 9 [ Lake Jelfer .
%}lumbn County Fire Station IS{ZI) NW Lake Jelfery 96 pal Cart g 7.00 1 52 § 36400
Columbia County Tibrary 435 NW Lall of [ amte — .
West Branch . Trontload 4 yd. | $ 28.00 1 32 § 1,456.00
%ﬁ)‘:;:‘yb“ County Main 308 Nw Columbia Ave, [Frontload 2yd. [§ 7.0 1 52 5 364.00
gﬂ.}‘ggb"“ County Shetif's 14919 1, US Highway 90 | Frontload 6yd. |§ 21,00 ! 52 § 1,092.00
Columbia County Sherifls . st v | T - . : _
Office Sub Station 347 Business Point Dr, | Frontload 2 yd, | $ 7.00 1 52 5 364.00
Courthouse Annex 135 NE Hernando Ave, | Frontload 8 yd. | § 28.00 5 52 $  7,280.00
Decp Creck Community 11934 N US Highway .
Conter _ . A4d] Trontload 2 yd. | $ 7.00 I 52 § 36400
gg}]‘t‘;’:"“ County Detention {309 Ny Quinten St | Frontload $yd. | $ 2800 5 52 $ 7,280.00
Guardian ad Litem ?:ils W Sister Welcome Trontload 2 yd. | $ 7.00 | 52 5 364.00
Lulu Community Center 205 SW Communily Cl. | Frontload 4 yd, | § 14,00 1 52 ¥ 728.00
Magon Cily Comniunity LLLTO S US THighway - ) e .
Centor 441 Frontload 4 yd. | $ 14,00 1 52 $ 72800
RC Track (L6 NV Bascom Frontload 8yd. | § 2800 ] 52 $ 145600
Iélcharclson Commumity 255 NE Coach Anders Frontload 2 yl. | § 7.00 | 52 § 36400

cnler Ln,
Rum Island Park ‘1‘;1;‘ SWRum Island 1 ioad 8yd. [$ 28,00 i 52 $ 1,456.00
South Columbia Ft, White o . ) . : :
Cmnmurﬁlv c@?euler 17579 SW SR 47 Frontload 4 yd. | § 14,00 1 52 $ 728.00
Springville Comuwunity J710 NW Suwannee . )
Cenlor Valley R Frontload 4 yd. | § 14,00 I 52 b 728.00
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Supervisors of Elections 1701 E Duval St. Frontload 2 yd. | $ 7.00 52 5 364.00
Watertown Lake 622 NE Williams St. Frontload 2 yd. | § 7.00 52 $ 36400
Westside Community Center 431 SW Birley Ave. Frontload 4 yd. | § 14,00 52 §  728.00
Winiield Community Conler 37\ winfield 81, | Frontload 4 yd. [$ 14,00 52 § 72800

and Récreational Area

Company Name:

Total County Services §

Waste Pro of Florida, Inc.
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ATTACHMENT A
BID FORM

All Residential and Commercial rates must take into account the following factors: the average
wait time at the landfill, which is currently around 12 minutes; the county's total area of 801
square miles with the longest distance to/from the landfill being around 30 miles, which affects
route mileage and fuel consumption; and the utilization of one (1) truck per route for the
collection of all waste from each parcel, serving as the foundation for route planning and cost
estimation. Contractors are required to incorporate these operational considerations into their
proposed pricing to guarantee accurate and sustainable service costs.

The undersigned, having carefully read and considered the instructions to propose for Bid No.
2026-C or Residential, Commercial, and Industrial Solid Waste Services, for Columbia County,
Florida, does hereby offer to perform such services on behalf of the County, of the type and
quality in the manner described, and subject to and in accordance with the terms and conditions
set forth in the Agreement documents at the rates, expressed in figures hereinafter set forth:

OPTION 1: Residential Solid Waste, Commercial Solid Waste, Industrial Solid Waste

Permanent Roll-Off Containers, and Construction and Demolition Waste Temporary Roll-Off
Containers

a. Curbside Service
b. Curbside Service with Contractor Supplied Carts

Option 1 shall include County services. See list below.
Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Mon‘ths of Re§1dent1al Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $ e 77 12 22,930 $ /359, 275,25
Backdoor Resident $ - X0 12 3 $ za, =
Second Pickup $ PP 12 22,930 $ 5 503,200, =
Yard Trash $ ) 25 12 22,930 $ l, 769, /30 =
Bulk Yard Debris $ L. 5P 12 22,930 $ /799, 550 =

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts § /2, 50/, /&3, *2

Company Name: __ £oporess s /Di?,ﬁd&d < :‘-/ Fecyclonl | LEC




OPTION 1

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service with

Contractor Supplied Carts Moqths of Rqs idential Extended Cost
service units

(cost per month)
Regular Resident $ /9.28 12 22,930 $ 55299591, &6
Backdoor Resident $ - 5B 12 8 $ zo. 2
Second Pickup 8 e e 12 22,930 $ s sv3,200.2
Yard Trash $ 4, 25 12 22,930 $ 7, 06%, </ 36, ag
Bulk Yard Debris $ L. 5T 12 22,930 $ /, 785, s, ag

&e

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $ /3 76/, </ 7/ =~

Company Name: MZ&S’S Lrspasacl !/(5754%5///19 LA




OPTION 1

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

| Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week

Small Commercial

(cart service) L @ 2% N/A N/A

2 yard frontload )

container § &89 $ 7767 $ ) 75,32

4 yard frontload $ $ $ o

container /76, z33, 3% 350,72

6 yard frontload $ ‘ g . g o

container | 757 37 350,72 sz6. 12

8 yard frontload .

container § z33 B2 S ey § Tors. V&

Industrial Solid Waste
Permanent Roll-Off Containers
Delivery/ Rental per ) .
Install monih Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard

2 yard stationary
compactor $ /(///1' 5 /\// A $ jrs % $ s se |NA
40 yard receiver , » e ~
container $ gy $ sz |% zs0,%® |3 sse |NA
30 yard self-contained " ce
compactor b 7S o= § 725 % $ szsw. $ L5 N/A
20 yard open top .
container $ 7S, = § )25, % $ 350.7% $ /6. 55 Yoo
30 yard open top _ )
container $ 75, < $ /25, o $ 2570, F $ 5/&,5}? $ & %=
40 yard open top o o p
container $ y 2ol § /25, $ g50.% |8 46.5¢ $ ¢

Company Name: 5%’,0;2&5) ,D/_éfpw/t A ?/ﬁgc}ﬂfquﬁ' LLEC




OPTION 1

Construction and Demolition Waste
Temporary Roll-Off Containers

Rental per

Delivery/Install month Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard
20 yard open top o . ae
container $ 78, 2 3 /25~ $ Ty, & $ </l ST $ o ™
30 yard open top . ] o w
container $ JS, T $ 725, = $ <850, $ <. 5% $ b ag
40 yard open top os o .
container $ 7s ¥ $ /EZ5. o $ sy, $ <. 208 L.
Company Name: __ Zxpress Dispasac ¥ Feayeliiis L




OPTION 2: Residential Solid Waste and Commetcial Solid Waste ONLY

a. With carts

b. Without carts

Option 2 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost
Curbside Service Mon‘ths of Re§.1dent1al Extended Cost
(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $ 577 12 22,930 $ < 359, 273, 28
Backdoor Resident $ 7 52 12 8 $ w20, 8
Second Pickup $ 20, %2 12 22,930 $ S 53, z00, 2
- ao
Bulk Yard Debris $ L. 12 22,930 $ 4 788, sve.

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $ /2, &0/, 763, #2

Company Name: Lxpreass DNispasal. 'R seye/rng 4L

OPTION 2




Monthly Cost X

Months X Residential Units

= Extended Cost

Curbside Service with Cr
Contractor Supplied Carts Mf)11‘ths of Rgs idential Extended Cost
service units

(cost per month)
Regular Resident $ /5y % 12 22,930 $ £ 299, 56/, “2
Backdoor Resident $ - S5 12 8 $ o, =
Second Pickup $ zo, “E 12 22,930 $ 5 503,700, L
Yard Trash $ %Zf_ 12 22,930 $ 1,169, 430, o
Bulk Yard Debris $ Go. 52 12 22,930 $ }, 768, 550, €

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $ /3, 7€/, 7/

Py

Company Name: _£xe ess D) s5posal z/ /D/S,}WSATCJ Y it




OPTION 2

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week
e I S L
e |8 smewe S e |8 s
::loﬁgcilnferf niond S i w $ 23z 82 $ 250 7%
Soﬁ;?nferf niond $  yosE $  gs0.72 $ sze.e
Ec;o};ilacllnﬁl(‘) nioad $ 233 32 S sz ¥ S Sp,

Company Name: _ £Ex j2ess _ Dns2as AL = Fezeye/1nl g pLLl




COUNTY SERVICES

Cost per pickup X Pickup(s) per Week X Weeks of Service = Extended Cost

Location Name Location Address C.ontamer/Cart Cost per pickup Pickup(s) Weelfs of Extended Cost
Size per week | Service
Animal Enforcement CR.25A Frontload 8yd. | $ 1 52 $ =
NnIor y 5—4‘ =3 Zig¢8~_

. n e
Animal Shelter 1392 NW Shelter Gln Frontload 8 yd. | $ £, oS 2 52 $ e, =
Annie Mattox Park 537 NE Center Ave Frontload 8 yd. | $ <%/ s 1 52 $ z,Ec &, ce
Bethlehem Community Center 835 SE Bethlehem Ave. Frontload 8yd | § = =< 1 52 $ 2z, 208 <

A ; .
Columbia County Emergency | o63 Ny Lake City Ave Frontload 6 yd. | $ o 2 52 $ cc
Operations Center 0, =— < z/2, %
Columbia County Offices 180 E Duval St Frontload 6yd 3 <5 = 1 52 $ Z . 06 e
v e Vi o
Columbia County Fire Station - "
2
440 508 SW State Road 247 Frontload4yd | $ z7. = 1 5 $ /, o</, ce
Columbia County Fire Station <
2
412 7264 NW US Highway 41 96 gal Cart $ ‘5{ 7/ 1 5 $ 273 =
Columbia County Fire Station 2 i 59 \
443 2318 SW Pmemount Hwy. 96 gal Cart $ </ !_z_/ 1 3 $ 2,372
Columbia County Fire Station -
445 12595 S US Highway 441 96 gal Cart $ </ 24 1 52 $ 2,372
Columbia County Fire Station - 1 59 $
416 495 SW Dortch St. Frontload2yd. | $ Pra 5 2. oc
Columbia County Fire Station n i 4 1 57 $ ce
448 370 SE Race Track Ln. Frontload 4yd. [ $ 27, = 2 7, o
Columbia County Fire Station | 4456 \w Mershon St. 96 gal Cart S o, i 1 52 S =,z 72

#50




Location Name Location Address gi(;ztainer/Cart Cost per pickup iiikvlstféls() ‘SZ:‘elli(cseOf Extended Cost
#Cgsollumbia County Fire Station 579 NW Lake Jeffery Rd. 96 gal Cart $ =/ 7” 1 52 $ 2,2 72
g?iﬁg;bm County Library West | 435w Hall of Fame Dr. Frontload 4yd. | $ 7 = 1 52 $ /e <<
Columbia County Main Library | 308 NW Columbia Ave. Frontload2yd. | § pra s* 1 52 $ —sz. <<
g(f)‘fl‘ilir:bia County Sheriff’s 4917 E US Highway 90 Frontload 6 yd. | $ 0. s% 1 52 $ =, /0. o=
gtf)flixzr:téibcsotzgtgfherift’s 347 Business Point Dr. Frontload2yd. | § 2z S0 1 52 $ —oz. =c
Courthouse Annex 135 NE Hernando Ave Frontload 8 yd | $ S = 5 52 $ 1, 5C. ad
Deep Creek Community Center | 11934 N US Highway 441 Frontload2yd. | $ /3. =e 1 52 $ —o2. €=
ggrllgbia County Detention 389 NW Quinten St. Frontload 8 yd. | §$ P s 5 52 $ s 050, g
Guardian ad Litem 885 SW Sister Welcome Rd. Frontload2yd | § /3. sz 1 52 $ Zoz. as
Lulu Community Center 205 SW Communtty Ct. Frontload4yd. | $ 27 i 1 52 $ /, 5/, ac
Mason City Community Center | 11110 S US Highway 441 Frontload 4 yd $ 27 =< 1 52 $ /. sross s<
RC Track 1516 NW Bascom Norris Dr. Frontload 8yd | § < e 1 52 $ Z, sos. °%
Richardson Community Center | 255 NE Coach Anders Ln. Frontload2yd. | $§ /3 5T 1 52 $ —32, <
Rum Island Park 1614 SW Rum Island Terr Frontload 8 yd. | § s co 1 52 $ z, 5oZ. <<




Location Name Location Address gi(;:tainer/Cart Cost per pickup giﬁkxi’gg ;Z::;?e()f Extended Cost
g‘(’)‘gﬁiﬁg‘“&’; ti ; White 17579 SW SR 47 Fromiload 4yd. |$ - <2 1 52 S s
Springville Community Center 3710 NW Suwannee Valley Rd. Frontload 4yd. | $ z7 s 1 52 $ ), <foss cc
Supervisors of Elections 1701 E Duval St. Frontload2yd. | § 17 <o 1 52 $ —oz. eg
Watertown Lake 622 NE Williams St. Frontload2yd. | $ /3. s 1 52 $ — <
Westside Community Center 431 SW Birley Ave Frontload 4 yd $ =7, < 1 52 $ /, 2/ 4’ L
Winfield Community Center and | 1327 NW Winfield St Frontload 4yd. |8 5, == 1 52 S ajrel
Total County Services $ 75, <86 =




ATTACHMENT A
BID FORM

All Residential and Commercial rates must take into account the following factors: the average
wait time at the landfill, which is currently around 12 minutes; the county's total area of 801
square miles with the longest distance to/from the landfill being around 30 miles, which affects
route mileage and fuel consumption; and the utilization of one (1) truck per route for the
collection of all waste from each parcel, serving as the foundation for route planning and cost
estimation. Contractors are required to incorporate these operational considerations into their
proposed pricing to guarantee accurate and sustainable service costs.

The undersigned, having carefully read and considered the instructions to propose for Bid No.
2026-C or Residential, Commercial, and Industrial Solid Waste Services, for Columbia County,
Florida, does hereby offer to perform such services on behalf of the County, of the type and
quality in the manner described, and subject to and in accordance with the terms and conditions
set forth in the Agreement documents at the rates, expressed in figures hereinafter set forth:

OPTION 1: Residential Solid Waste, Commercial Solid Waste, Industrial Solid Waste

Permanent Roll-Off Containers, and Construction and Demolition Waste Temporary Roll-Off
Containers

a. Curbside Service
b. Curbside Service with Contractor Supplied Carts
Option 1 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Seolid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of [Residential
. . Extended Cost
(cost per month) service units
. - 0
Regular Resident $ /). Al 12 22,930 $ 2 30,1\ '3
Backdoor Resident $ 26. 61 12 8 $ 256 0.5%
Second Pickup $ No B0 12 22,930 $ -
Yard Trash $ )N Lo 0ED 46N€ 12 22,930 $ -
. 6000 AL _

Bulk Yard Debris $ /2,0 Jen Y Py 12 22,930 $

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $ ?l Ht 3" 67,

SA

Company Name: Ve 212140 WﬂS'TE‘ ;45&(0»4- lLic




J

OPTION 1

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service with

Contractor Supplied Carts Sl\gf‘ggés of Elfist;dentlal Extended Cost

(cost per month)
Regular Resident $ /3 58 12 22,930 $ 2 641,640, 8o
Backdoor Resident $g8 3% 12 8 $ A 7”,(,_[.‘\ )
Second Pickup $ A B0 12 22,930 $ —
Yard Trash $/ﬂccdﬂ(,‘0 Above 12 02.930 $ -
Bulk Yard Debris | § 9501 &% 12 2930  |[$ —

(22 Ler Jq2q

AR
Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts§ 53 6 U, 3657

Company Name: ME/“W&"/ N‘fS’(E %{oﬂ,\at-\( LLC




OPTION 1

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week
(S;;ius gggg)lercml $ 4500 N/A N/A
coniner | $63.7 512245 571,17
container |8 Jant* $a54.70 529a°"
So};lﬁ(iing: nioad $ 17/, X $Z 802‘? A $ s 35"
i D P R
Industrial Solid Waste
Permanent Roll-Off Containers
g:iia\;fry/ Iizrgfhl pet Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard
ooy Sy 5 — s —  |w
Tl O O " P i LY
(3;(()) n);;itierlf—contained $ $ P g 2 P g (o 0 N/A
coneiner " |Syac |8 g5 Squs ™ [Seswe |8
conainer ST |Serm S [$ge™ |8
Wyadopen b g 2e=  S06 T (ST (865 |3

Note! Aee Lates Shomn Atvs fo Not [mervae //‘,% FRAnCHSE e

Company Name: ME/LIINI‘}AJ /\/ A7 ;44/2444 e




J

OPTION 1

Construction and Demolition Waste
Temporary Roll-Off Containers

Delivery/Install Rentgl pet Per Pull Disposal
month
Per ton Per cubic yard

20 yard open top . _ _ : _

container $ [AS $/0f 3’010'( e $ Y6.5° $

30 yard open top _ _ i _

container $/ﬂ$" $ 05 3’;}4{ $ yg.50 $ ~

40 yard open top _ _ _ _
container $//ls’ $4/0 $ggf $ 4g.5© $

NoT€E” /hu Lot SHomn A flov € Ao

Company Name: Mfﬂ-‘ﬂ(/‘f/\/ N457€ 74@04 LLC

Not Inewoe /R % FRANCHISE Fee,



J OPTION 2: Residential Solid Waste and Commercial Solid Waste ONLY

a. With carts

b. Without carts

Option 2 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service

Months of

Residential

(cost per month) service units Extended Cost
Regular Resident $”‘ o1 12 22,930 $ 2,207, 20
Backdoor Resident $ 6. 67 12 8 $ 2,560 37
Second Pickup $ No 1o 12 22,930 $ -
Yard Trash $ Jnecoaen Abowe 12 22,930 $ -
Bulk Yard Debris | $ /"5"_'_'."/;’;: Yoo 12 22,930 |$ 0~

}

Ky
Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $ ?1 Al ?l 1.

Company Name: MC'/“W/HJ W aste Aaﬂ—wﬂt e

OPTION 2




Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service with

Contractor Supplied Carts Moqths of Re:s idential Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $ '2-?9 12 22,930 $ 368,610 g0
Backdoor Resident $ 29 ¢ 12 8 $ 2,724. ¢
Second Pickup $ No Fin 12 22,930 $ —
Yard Trash $ Incevoen Adove 12 22,930 $ —
Bulk Yard Debris | $ /‘;,ff' ‘:j;;; St 12 22,930 |8 —

7
28

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $ z 4 8 L { ?G"(“

Company Name: /"75/&4:4,\/ Aﬁi.ﬂé’ Aaﬂ—m-‘l LC




OPTION 2

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week
e T
onainer | $¢37 127 $9).11
comainer 378796 5 25,9 S 2527
conainer |3 19117 5 9.7 5 7252
container | S 4547 5 5017 704

N(ﬂe—,' Ahf ﬂA’TES ﬁ-}dﬂt\/ ,4[}0(/&' Do I\YO"( lNCLVﬂg /01% /MD&‘\U‘E’KEE‘.

Company Name: /4 ERI 1A /;/:45'76" /{;fuﬂﬂf lcc




COUNTY SERVICES - fon. Borv OPTION | 4ny Oation

Cost per pickup X Pickup(s) per Week X Weeks of Service = Extended Cost

Location Name Location Address gi(:eltainer/Cart Cost per pickup I;ieikxggg ;Zi;l.(::f Extended Cost
Animal Enforcement C.R.25A Frontload 8yd. | § s—@ < o% 1 52 $ ZG ol. s6
Animal Shelter 1392 NW Shelter Gln. Frontload 8 yd. | 8 <o, o¥% 2 52 $ {1 203 {2
Annie Mattox Park 537 NE Center Ave Frontload 8 yd. | $ <0 © 2 1 52 $ 2,66C se
Bethlehem Community Center 835 SE Bethlehem Ave. Frontload8yd. | $ 5-0‘0 7 1 52 $ 2.66( ‘5 (3
g;g’;‘;;ifg:;gfmergemy 263 NW Lake City Ave. Frontload 6yd. | $ geq S 2 52 52 9 2° 8
Columbia County Offices 180 E Duval St Frontload 6yd | § 727, s 1 52 $ /, 954 oM
g:éumbia County Fire Station 508 SW State Road 247 Frontload4yd. | $ 2. o2 1 52 3 /, 20(. oY
ggumbia County Fire Station | 24\ US Highway 41 96 gal Cart $ o, g0 1 52 $ 2 ;c;,é o
Colombia County Fire Stafion | 531 SW Pinemount Hwy. 96 galCart | $ ¢, 70 1 52 5 209.8°
ggumbia County Fire Station | 1,565 5 s Highway 441 96 gal Cart S, 70 1 52 $ 254 80
gfémbia County Fire Station | 495 sw Dortch St. Frontload 2yd. | $ ;4 s 1 52 $¢ 0.S%
g:éumbia County Fire Station | 376 SE Race Track Ln. Frontload 4 yd. | $ 7¢- 0% 1 52 $ 1,30l ot
Columbla County Fire SHOR | 1456 NW Mershon St. 96 gal Cart $ 4,20 1 52 $9.¢4.8°

A




Location Name Location Address gi(;ztainer/Cart Cost per pickup giikxgi) ;Z:li{:eOf Extended Cost
g;’%mnbia County Fire Station | 579 \ryy 1 ake Jeffery Rd. 96 gal Cart $ ¢, 70 1 52 $ 95, 8
ggn“g;bia County Library West | 435 W Hall of Fame Dr. Frontload 4yd. | S , - 02 1 52 5 1301,
Columbia County Main Library | 308 NW Columbia Ave. Frontload2yd. | § /Q. 51 1 52 3 %) s
S%BCI:bia County Sheriff’s 4917 E US Highway 90 Frontload 6vd. | § 37, 2 1 52 3 /? 7 ¢
ggéucneﬂ;i:bcso;gfheﬁfﬁ’ s 347 Business Point Dr. Fromtload2yd. | $ /A e 1 52 3 é sD. <2
Courthouse Annex 135 NE Hernando Ave. Frontload 8yd. | § {0‘_03 5 52 $ { g‘ 067 80
Deep Creek Community Center | 11934 N US Highway 441 Frontload 2 yd. | $ (A st 1 52 $ é w’f 2z
g:rlgbia County Detention 389 NW Quinten St. Frontload 8 yd. | $ 5’o,°§ 5 52 $ 13 007, 80
Guardian ad Litem 885 SW Sister Welcome Rd. Frontload2yd. | $ yZ3 s 1 52 $ A s <
Lulu Community Center 205 SW Community Ct. Frontload4yd. | § 3 $.0 (& 1 52 3 (3¢} .oﬂ(
Mason City Community Center | 11110 S US Highway 441 Frontload4yd. | $ AS X2 1 52 3 ‘?OL of
RC Track 1516 NW Bascom Norris Dr. Frontload 8yd. | $ ¢p, 63 1 52 $ 2661 ‘3'(;
Richardson Community Center | 255 NE Coach Anders La. Frontload2yd. | $ / 2_5 { 1 52 $ 6<0 ,g z
Rum Island Park 1614 SW Rum Island Terr. Frontload 8 yd. | $ ¢p) 0% 1 52 $ 2601.5




i rt . Pickup(s) | Weeks of
Location Name Location Address git;létalner/Ca Cost per pickup pe‘x:' ngk) Se:ice Extended Cost
South Columbia Ft. White
Community Center 17579 SW SR 47 Frontload4yd. | $ 2 STOZ 1 52 $ k19, [ . oY
Springville Community Center | 3710 NW Suwannee Valley Rd. Frontload4vyd. | § a< e 1 52 $ i0 l o
Supervisors of Elections 1701 E Duval St. Frontload2yd. | $ / ;‘5’ ! 1 52 $ C’ w‘s'Z-
Watertown Lake 622 NE Williams St. Frontload2yd. | § /A <l 1 52 3 é <0 ‘51-
Westside Community Center 431 SW Birley Ave. Frontload4yd. | $ ; §° Z i 52 $ (30 l , oY
Winfield Community Center and | , ., . . 6
R A 1327 NW Winfield St. Frontload 4yd. | $ g~ 02 1 52 $ (30].°t
RO
Total County Services $ 7021 8.

9 [ —

Neote: Do lycer Soons Alove Jo No1 [mecaae /A% framedise Fec.

M Emaps Uacte ,f(,omaa LLC




ATTACHMENT A
BID FORM

All Residential and Commercial rates must take into account the following factors: the average
wait time at the landfill, which is currently around 12 minutes; the county's total area of 801
square miles with the longest distance to/from the landfill being around 30 miles, which affects
route mileage and fuel consumption; and the utilization of one (1) truck per route for the
collection of all waste from each parcel, serving as the foundation for route planning and cost
estimation. Contractors are required to incorporate these operational considerations into their
proposed pricing to guarantee accurate and sustainable service costs.

The undersigned, having carefully read and considered the instructions to propose for Bid No.
2026-C or Residential, Commercial, and Industrial Solid Waste Services, for Columbia County,
Florida, does hereby offer to perform such services on behalf of the County, of the type and
quality in the manner described, and subject to and in accordance with the terms and conditions
set forth in the Agreement documents at the rates, expressed in figures hereinafter set forth:

OPTION 1: Residential Solid Waste, Commercial Solid Waste, Industrial Solid Waste
Permanent Roll-Off Containers, and Construction and Demolition Waste Temporary Roll-Off
Containers

a. Curbside Service

b. Curbside Service with Contractor Supplied Carts

Option 1 shall include County services. See list below.
Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of [Residential
. . Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $12.03 12 22,930 $3,310,174.80
Backdoor Resident $12.03 12 3 $1,154.88
Second Pickup $ 7.97 12 22,930 $2,193,025.20
Yard Trash $ 1.35 12 22,930 $371,466.00
Bulk Yard Debris $ PerCall 12 22,930 $-

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $ 3,682,795.68/5,875820.88

Company Name: Adams Sanitation Holding Company




OPTION 1

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service with s
Contractor Supplied Carts Moqths of Re.51dent1al Extended Cost
service units

(cost per month)
Regular Resident $13.75 12 22,930 $ 3,783,450.00
Backdoor Resident $13.75 12 8 $1,320.00
Second Pickup $ 7.97 12 02,930 $2,193,025.20
Yard Trash $ 1.35 12 22,930 $ 371,466.00
Bulk Yard Debris $ Per Call 12 02,930 $ -

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $ 4,156,236.00/6,349.261.20

Company Name: Adams Sanitation Holding Company




OPTION 1

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week
o soraieg T | s17.92 N/A N/A
ioﬁﬁnf:f niload $71.68 $143.36 $215.04
io};le}cgciinf;? nlond $106.77 $213.55 $320.32
6 yard itontload $160.16 $320.32 $480.48
Sos;x?t;(ijngf niload $213.55 $427.09 $640.64
Industrial Solid Waste
Permanent Roll-Off Containers
I?]Z}[z;‘/ry/ ii?fg: per Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard
ioﬁf,is:z?onary $224.00 $151.20 $184.80 $52.08 N/A
ggn}t':;g e’f’ceiver $280.00 $280.00 $330.40 $52.08 N/A
2gn}l’gzcitierlf'°°main°d $252.00 $280.00 $330.40 $52.08 N/A
ignytgifgejtp en top $224.00 $252.00 $330.40 $5 08 $7.25
2211’;:;3;1’ en fop $252.00 $280.00 $330.40 $52.08 §7.25
333;:;36? en top $280.00 $280.00 $330.40 $52.08 $7.95

Company Name: Adams Sanitation Holding Company




[Up—

OPTION 1

Construction and Demolition Waste
Temporary Roll-Off Containers

. Rental per .
Delivery/Install month Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard

20 yard open top )

container 3 $84.00 $448.00 $52.08 $6.75

30 yard open top i

container $ $84.00 $560.00 $52.08 $6.75

40 yard open top

container $ - $84.00 $672.00 $52.08 $6.75

Company Name: Adams Sanitation Holding Company




OPTION 2: Residential Solid Waste and Commercial Solid Waste ONLY
a. With carts
b. Without carts

Option 2 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of |[Residential
. . Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $12.03 12 22,930 $ 3,310,174.80
Backdoor Resident $12.03 12 8 $1,154.88
Second Pickup $ 7.97 12 22,930 $ 2,193,025.20
Yard Trash $ 1.35 12 22,930 $ 371,466.00
Bulk Yard Debris $ Per Call 12 22,930 $ -

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $ 3,682,795.68/5.875.820.88

Company Name: Adams Sanitation Holding Company
OPTION 2




Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service with

Contractor Supplied Carts Moqths of Re.s idential Extended Cost
service units

(cost per month)
Regular Resident $13.75 12 22,930 $3,783,450.00
Backdoor Resident $13.75 12 8 $1,320.00
Second Pickup $ 7.97 12 22,930 $2,193,025.20
Yard Trash $1.35 12 22,930 $371,466.00
Bulk Yard Debris $ Per Call 12 22,930 $ -

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $ 4.156.236.00/6.349.261.20

Company Name: Adams Sanitation Holding Company




OPTION 2

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week
Small Commercial $ 17.92 N/A N/A
(cart service)
2 yarczl frontload $71.68 $ 143.36 $215.04
container
4 yard frontload $106.77 $ 213.55 $320.32
container
6 yard frontload
e $160.16 $320.32 $ 480.48
8 yarq frontload $213.55 $ 427.09 $ 640.44
container

Company Name: Adams Sanitation Holding Company




COUNTY SERVICES

Cost per pickup X Pickup(s) per Week X Weeks of Service = Extended Cost

Container/Cart

Pickuap(s)

‘Weeks of

Location Name Location Address Size Cost per pickup per week | Service Extended Cost
Animal Enforcement CR.25A Frontload 8 yd. | $175.00 1 52 $9,100.00
Animal Shelter 1392 NW Shelter Gln. Frontload 8 yd. | $175.00 2 52 $18,200.00
Annie Mattox Park 537 NE Center Ave Frontload 8 yd. | $175.00 1 52 $9,100.00
Bethlehem Community Center | 835 SE Bethlehem Ave. Frontload 8 yd. | $175.00 1 52 $9.100.00
g;le“r:ﬁzscggg’fmergmy 263 NW Lake City Ave. Frontload 6 yd. | $135.00 2 52 $14,040.00
Columbia County Offices 180 E Duval St Frontload 6yd | $ 135.00 1 52 $7,020.00
Columbia County Fire Stafion | 508 SW State Road 247 Frontload 4yd. | § 87.50 1 52 $4,550.00
#Cg“m*’ia County Fire Station | >4 \w US Highway 41 96 gal Cart $14.45 1 52 $751.40
gg“mbia County Fire Station. | 5318 Sw Pinemount Hwy. 96 gal Cart $14.45 1 52 $751.40
Columbia County Fire S&lon | 12505 § US Highway 441 96 gal Cart $14.45 1 52 $751.40
#C;’é“m"ia County Fire Station | 405 oW Dortch St. Frontload 2yd. | $ 60.00 1 52 $3,120.00
Columbia County Fire S&ation | 370 SE Race Track L. Frontload 4yd. | $87.50 1 52 $4,550.00
Columbia County Fire Station 1456 NW Mershon St. 96 gal Cart $14.45 1 52 $3,120.00

#50




[RSSEI,

Container/Cart

Pickup(s)

‘Weeks of

Location Name Location Address Size Cost per pickup per week | Service Extended Cost
oumbia County Fire S@HOR | 579 NW Lake Jeffery Rd. 96 gal Cart $14.45 1 52 $751.40
ggnuﬁlbia County Library West | 435\ Hall of Fame Dr. Frontload 4 yd. | $87.50 1 52 $4,550.00
Columbia County Main Library | 308 NW Columbia Ave. Frontload 2yd. | $60.00 1 52 $3,120.00
g‘é‘ifbia County Sheriff’s 4917 E US Highway 90 Frontload 6 yd. | $135.00 1 52 $7,020.00
8(1‘)315“:::?&080 tl;?itgnSherist 347 Business Point Dr. Frontload 2 yd. | $60.00 1 52 $3,120.00
Courthouse Annex 135 NE Hernando Ave. Frontload 8 yd. | $175.00 5 52 $45,500.00
Deep Creek Community Center | 11934 N US Highway 441 Frontload 2yd. | $60.00 1 52 $3,120.00
Columbia County Detention | 309 W Quinten St. Frontload 8 yd. | $175.00 5 52 $45,500.00
Guardian ad Litem 885 SW Sister Welcome Rd. Frontload 2yd. | $60.00 1 52 $3,120.00
Lulu Community Center 205 SW Community Ct. Frontload4yd. | $87.50 1 52 $4,550.00
Mason City Community Center | 11110 S US Highway 441 Frontload 4yd. | $87.50 1 52 $4,550.00
RC Track 1516 NW Bascom Norris Dr. Frontload 8 yd. | $175.00 1 52 $9,100.00
Richardson Commumity Center | 255 NE Coach Anders Ln. Frontload 2yd. | $60.00 1 52 $3,120.00
Rum Island Park 1614 SW Rum Island Terr. Frontload 8 yd. | $175.00 1 52 $ 9,100.00




Container/Cart

Pickup(s)

‘Weeks of

Location Name Location Address . Cost per pickup . Extended Cost
Size per week | Service

South Columbia Ft. White

Community Center 17579 SW SR 47 Frontload 4 yd. | $ 87.50 1 52 $4,550.00

Springville Community Center | 3710 NW Suwannee Valley Rd. Frontload 4yd. | $87.50 1 52 $4,550.00

Supervisors of Elections 1701 E Duval St. Frontload 2 yd. | $60.00 1 52 $3,120.00

Watertown Lake 622 NE Williams St. Frontload 2 yd. | $60.00 1 52 $3,120.00

Westside Community Center 431 SW Birley Ave. Frontload 4 yd. | $87.50 1 52 $ 4,550.00

Winfield Community Center and | ;37 Ny Winfield St. Frontload 4yd. | $87.50 1 52 $4,550.00

Recreational Area

Total County Services $ 252,447.00




ATTACHMENT A
BID FORM

All Residential and Commercial rates must take into account the following factors: the average
wait time at the landfill, which is currently around 12 minutes; the county's total area of 801
square miles with the longest distance to/from the landfill being around 30 miles, which affects
route mileage and fuel consumption; and the utilization of one (1) truck per route for the
collection of all waste from each parcel, serving as the foundation for route planning and cost
estimation. Contractors are required to incorporate these operational considerations into their
proposed pricing to guarantee accurate and sustainable service costs.

The undersigned, having carefully read and considered the instructions to propose for Bid No.
2026-C or Residential, Commercial, and Industrial Solid Waste Services, for Columbia County,
Florida, does hereby offer to perform such services on behalf of the County, of the type and
quality in the manner described, and subject to and in accordance with the terms and conditions
set forth in the Agreement documents at the rates, expressed in figures hereinafter set forth:

OPTION 1: Residential Solid Waste, Commercial Solid Waste, Industrial Solid Waste
Permanent Roll-Off Containers, and Construction and Demolition Waste Temporary Roll-Off
Containers

a. Curbside Service
b. Curbside Service with Contractor Supplied Carts
Option 1 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of |Residential
. . Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $ 19.70 12 22,930 $  5,420,652.00
Backdoor Resident $ 12.00 12 8 $ 1,152.00
Second Pickup $ 17.00 12 22,930 $  4,677,720.00*
Yard Trash $ 5.03%% 12 22,930 $  1,631,698.80%*
Bulk Yard Debris $ 3.25 12 22,930 $ 894,270.00

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $

Company Name:

FCC Environmental Services Florida, LLC

12,625,492.80




OPTION 1

Monthly Cost X

Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service with s

Contractor Supplied Carts ggf\ﬁtcts of uRl;cistlSdentlal Extended Cost

(cost per month)
Regular Resident $ 22.42 12 22,930 $  6,169,087.20
Backdoor Resident $ 12.00 12 8 $  1,152.00
Second Pickup $ 17.00 12 22,930 $ 4,677,720.00%
Yard Trash $ 5.93%%* 12 02,930 $ 1,631,698.80%*
Bulk Yard Debris $ 3.25 12 2,930 $ 894,270.00

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $

13,373,928.00

*Second Pickup Cost would only apply to residents that subscribe for the additional service. The extended
prices is representative of the entire County receiving second pickup rather than the cost for the actual number
of residents that subscribe for the service.

**Yard Trash monthly and extended cost would only apply if the County determined that garbage and yard
trash would need to be collected separately. FCC's rate for Regular Resident considers a service approach in
which garbage and yard waste are collected at a single collection point.

Company Name:

FCC Environmental Services Florida, LLC




OPTION 1

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week

Small Commercial

(cart service) $ 1675 N/A N/A

2 yarc.l frontload $  129.21 $ 25841 $  387.62

container

4 yard frontload 516.83 775 .24

container $ 25841 $ $

6 yard frontload 775 24 1.162.86

container $ 38762 $ ' § S

8 yard frontload $  516.83 §  1,033.66 § 15,5049

container

Industrial Solid Waste
Permanent Roll-Off Containers
Delivery/ Rental per .
Install month Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard

2 yard stationary 33.45 65.50
compactor $ 500.00 $ 250.00 $ $ . N/A
40 yard receiver § 50000 |$ 25000 |$ 479.61 $  65.50 N/A
container
30 yard self-contained | ¢ 55000 |§ 55000 |§ s0461 |$ 6550 N/A
compactor
20 yard open top $ 20000 |$ 12500 |$ 45461 |$ 6550 $  NA
container
30 yard open top 125.00 N/A
container $ 200.00 $ . $ 454.61 $ 6550 $
40 yard open top .
container $  200.00 $ 125.00 § 454.61 $ 6550 $ N/A

Company Name:

FCC Environmental Services Florida, LLC




OPTION 1

Construction and Demolition Waste
Temporary Roll-Off Containers

Delivery/Install Rental per Per Pull Disposal

month

Per ton Per cubic yard

20 yard open top 125.00 A
container $200.00 $ : $§ 45461 $ 4650 $
30 yard open top /A
container 5 20000 |$ 12500 § 45461  |§ 4650 |$ N/
40 yard open top
container $  200.00 $ 125.00 $ 45461 $  46.50 $ NA

Company Name:

FCC Environmental Services Florida, LLC




OPTION 2: Residential Solid Waste and Commercial Solid Waste ONLY

a. With carts

b. Without carts

Option 2 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of [Residential
] . \ Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $ 18.83 12 22,930 $ 5,181,262.80
Backdoor Resident $  12.00 12 8 $ 1,152.00
Second Pickup $ 17.00 12 22,930 $ 4,677,720.00*
Yard Trash $ 5.84%%* 12 22,930 $  1,606,934.40%*
Bulk Yard Debris $ 3.25 12 22,930 $  894,270.00

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $

*Second Pickup Cost would only apply to residents that subscribe for the additional service. The extended
prices is representative of the entire County receiving second pickup rather than the cost for the actual number

of residents that subscribe for the service.

**Yard Trash monthly and extended cost would only apply if the County determined that garbage and yard
trash would need to be collected separatety. FCC's rate for Regular Resident considers a service approach in

12,361,339.20

which garbage and yard waste are collected at a single collection point.

Company Name;
OPTION 2

FCC Environmental Services Florida, LLC




Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service with

Contractor Supplied Carts ls\glo‘fllthes of lfl{;;;dentlal Extended Cost

(cost per month)
Regular Resident $ 21.58 12 22,930 $  5,937,952.80
Backdoor Resident $ 12.00 12 8 $ 1,152.00
Second Pickup $ 17.00 12 22,930 $  4,677,720.00*
Yard Trash $  5.84%* 12 22,930 $  1,606,934.40%*
Bulk Yard Debris $ 325 12 22,930 $  894,270.00

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $

13,118,029.20

*Second Pickup Cost would only apply to residents that subscribe for the additional service. The extended
prices is representative of the entire County receiving second pickup rather than the cost for the actual number
of residents that subscribe for the service.

**Yard Trash monthly and extended cost would only apply if the County determined that garbage and yard
trash would need to be collected separately. FCC's rate for Regular Resident considers a service approach in
which garbage and yard waste are collected at a single collection point.

Company Name:

FCC Environmental Services Florida, LLC




OPTION 2

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week
Small Commercial
(cart service) $ 1675 N/A NiA
2 yard frontload

. 258.41

container $ 12921 $ $ 387.62
4 yard frontload §  258.41 S  516.83 $ 77524
container
6 yard frontload $  387.62 $ 77524 §  1,162.86
container
8yarq frontload §  516.83 $ 1,033.66 $  1,550.49
container

Company Name:

FCC Environmental Services Florida, LLC




COUNTY SERVICES

Cost per pickup X Pickup(s) per Week X Weeks of Service = Extended Cost

Location Name Location Address gic;:tainer/Cart Cost per pickup ll:gl:l‘tge(ls() ;Zis;‘::f Extended Cost
Animal Enforcement CR.25A Frontload8yd [$ 11936 1 52 $ 6,206 72
Anmmal Shelter 1392 NW Shelter Gin. Frontload8yd. |$ 11936 2 52 $ 12,413 44
Annie Mattox Park 537 NE Center Ave Frontload 8 yd $ 119 36 1 52 $ 6,206 72
Bethlehem Community Center | 835 SE Bethlehem Ave. Frontload 8 yd. | $ 119 36 1 52 $ 6,206 72
8(;2:1;}25;5(38:::;Emergency 263 NW Lake City Ave Frontload 6 yd. | $ 89 52 2 52 $ 9,310 08
Columbia County Offices 180 E Duval St Frontload 6yd $ 89 52 1 52 $ 4,655 04
Columbia County Fure SIton | 508 sw State Road 247 Frontfload4yd |$ 59 68 1 52 $ 310336
f;’é“mb‘a County Fire Station | ¢4 N US Highway 41 96 gal Cart s 1675 1 52 $  g7100
#Cz)Blumbm County Frre Station 2318 SW Pmemount Hwy 96 gal Cart $ 16 75 1 52 $ 871 00
ﬁ’;“mb‘a County Fire Station 1 15595 5 g Highway 441 96 gal Cart $ 1675 1 52 $ 87100
g:gumbm County Fire Station 1 405 sw Dortch St. Frontioad 2yd. | $ 29 84 1 52 $ 1,551 68
m“mb”‘ County Fire Station | 374 sp Race Track Ln. Frontload4yd. |$ 59 68 1 52 $ 310336
g;’(l)“mb‘a County Fire Statton | 45 N Mershon St. 96 gal Cart $ 1675 1 52 $ 87100




Location Name Location Address gi(:eltainer/Cart Cost per pickup ;’:.kwugéls() ;‘éisli{cse()f Extended Cost
g;’ll“mbm County Fire Station | 50 N Lake Jeffery Rd. 96 gal Cart $ 1675 1 52 $ 87100
g?;ﬁg;?la County Library West | 435 Nw Hall of Fame Dr Frontload 4 yd. | $ 59 68 1 52 $  3,10336
Columbia County Main Library | 308 NW Columbia Ave. Frontload 2 yd. | $ 29 84 i 52 $ 155168
g?fl,llgbm County Shertf’s 4917 E US Highway 90 Frontload 6 yd. | $ 8952 1 52 $ 465504
gcf);it':l;ljbcsc)tl;}[gfhenft’s 347 Business Point Dr Frontload2yd | § 29 84 1 52 $ 1,551 68
Courthouse Annex 135 NE Hernando Ave. Frontload 8 yd. | $ 11936 5 52 $  31,03360
Deep Creek Community Center | 11934 N US Highway 441 Frontload 2 yd. | $ 29 84 1 52 $  1,55168
ggl':t';‘b‘a County Detention 389 NW Quinten St. Frontload 8 yd. | $ 119 36 5 52 $ 31,0360
Guardian ad Litem 885 SW Sister Welcome Rd. Frontload 2 yd. | $ 29 84 1 52 $  1,55168
Lulu Commumty Center 205 SW Community Ct. Frontload4yd | $ 59 68 1 52 $ 310336
Mason City Commumty Center | 11110 S US Highway 441 Frontload4yd | § 59 68 1 52 $ 3,103 36
RC Track 1516 NW Bascom Norris Dr Frontload8yd | § 119 36 1 52 $ 6,206 72
Richardson Community Center | 255 NE Coach Anders Ln Frontload2yd. | $ 29 84 1 52 $ 1,551 68
Rum Island Park 1614 SW Rum Istand Terr Frontload 8yd | $ 119 36 i 52 $ 6,206 72




Location Name Location Address gi(:eltainer/Cart Cost per pickup ::g‘kx([:éi? ;‘;i:li(:e(’f Extended Cost
g‘;‘;}r‘nﬁﬁ};}"é’;g White 17579 SW SR 47 Fronfloaddyd. |$ 5968 i 52 $ 3,10336
Springville Commumity Center | 3710 NW Suwannee Valley Rd. Frontload 4 yd. | $ 59 68 1 52 $ 3,103 36
Supervisors of Elections 1701 E Duval St. Frontload 2yd. | $ 29 84 1 52 $  1,55168
Watertown Lake 622 NE Williams St Frontload2yd. | § 29 84 1 52 $ 1,551 68
Westside Commumty Center 431 SW Burley Ave. Frontload 4yd. | $ 5968 1 52 $  3,10336
Winfie\d Community Conter and | 1397 Nw Wantield St Frontload4yd. | § 5968 1 52 $ 310336

J Total County Services $ 168,833 08




ATTACHMENT A
BID FORM

All Residential and Commercial rates must take into account the following factors: the average
wait time at the landfill, which is currently around 12 minutes; the county's total area of 8§01
square miles with the longest distance to/from the landfill being around 30 miles, which affects
route mileage and fuel consumption; and the utilization of one (1) truck per route for the
collection of all waste from each parcel, serving as the foundation for route planning and cost
estimation. Contractors are required to incorporate these operational considerations into their
proposed pricing to guarantee accurate and sustainable service costs.

The undersigned, having carefully read and considered the instructions to propose for Bid No.
2026-C or Residential, Commercial, and Industrial Solid Waste Services, for Columbia County,
Florida, does hereby offer to perform such services on behalf of the County, of the type and
quality in the manner described, and subject to and in accordance with the terms and conditions
set forth in the Agreement documents at the rates, expressed in figures hereinafter set forth:

OPTION 1: Residential Solid Waste, Commercial Solid Waste, Industrial Solid Waste ‘

Permanent Roll-Off Containers, and Construction and Demolition Waste Temporary Roll-Off
Containers

a. Curbside Service
b. Curbside Service with Contractor Supplied Carts
Option 1 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of |Residential
_ . . Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $ 14.00 12 22,930 ¢ 3,852,240
Backdoor Resident $ 10.00 12 8 $ 960.00
Second Pickup $ 8.00 12 22,930 $ 2,201,280
Yard Trash $ 227 12 22,930 $ 624,613.20
Bulk Yard Debris $ 5.65 12 22,930 $ 1,554,654

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $

Company Name: Coastal Waste & Recycling, Inc.

8,233,747.20
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OPTION 1

Monthly Cost X

Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service with , . .
Contractor Supplied Carts Mon.ths of Re_s V1dent1a1 Extended Cost
service units

(cost per month)
Regular Resident $ 14.78 12 22,930 ¢ 4,066,864.80
Backdoor Resident $ 10.00 12 3 $  960.00
Second Pickup $ 8.00 12 22,930 $ 2,201,280
Yard Trash $ 227 12 22,930 $ 624,613.20
Bulk Yard Debris $ 5.65 12 02,930 $ 1,554,654

8,448,372.00

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $

Company Name: Coastal Waste & Recycling, Inc.
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OPTION 1

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week

Smflll CO}nmermal ¢ 175.00 N/A N/A

(cart service)

2 yarc.i frontload ¢ 96.93 ¢ 193.87 ¢ 290.80

container

4 yard frontload ¢ 193.87 $ 387.73 $ 581.60

container

6 yarc‘l frontload $ 290.80 $581.60 $ 872.40

container

8 yarc.l frontload § 387.73 § 775.46 ¢ 1163.20

container

Industrial Solid Waste
Permanent Roll-Off Containers
Delivery/ Rental per .
Install month Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard

2 yard stationary $ 300.00 $ 250.00 $ 385.00 $ 74.43 N/A
compactor
40 ya.rd receiver $ 300.00 ¢ 300.00 $ 385.00 $ 7443 N/A
container
30 yard self-contained ¢ 300.00 ¢ 600.00 $ 385.00 ¢ 7443 N/A
compactor
20 yard open top g 115.00 ¢ 150.00 $ 385.00 § 7443 $ 18.50
contamer
30 ya}*d open top ¢ 115.00 $ 150.00 $ 385.00 g 7443 $ 18.50
container
40 yard open top 150.00 385.00 74.43 18.50
container $ 115.00 $ 5 B ‘ b .

Company Name: Coastal Waste & Recycling, Inc.
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OPTION 1

Construction and Demolition Waste
Temporary Roll-Off Containers

Rental per

Delivery/Install month Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard
20 yard open top $ 115.00 § 150.00 § 38500 | 52.85 g 14.00
container
30 yard open top $ 115.00 $ 150.00 ¢ 385.00 g 5285 ¢ 14.00
container
40ya.rdopentop $ 115.00 § 150.00 ¢ 385.00 ¢ 52.85 ¢ 14.00
container

) Company Name: Coastal Waste & Recycling, Inc.
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OPTION 2: Residential Solid Waste and Commercial Solid Waste ONLY
a. With carts
b. Without carts

Option 2 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of [Residential _
. . Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $ 14.00 12 22,930 ¢ 3,852,240
Backdoor Resident $ 10.00 12 8 $  960.00
Second Pickup $ 8.00 12 22,930 $ 2,201,280
Yard Trash $ 227 12 22,930 § 624,613.20
Bulk Yard Debris $ 5.65 12 22,930 ¢ 1,554,654

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $

8,233,747.20

Company Name: Coastal Waste & Recycling, Inc.

OPTION 2
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Monthly Cost X

Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service with

Contractor Supplied Carts Mon‘ths of Re_s idential Extended Cost
service units

(cost per month)
Regular Resident $ 1478 12 22,930 ¢ 4,066,864.80
Backdoor Resident ¢ 10.00 12 8 g 960.00
Second Pickup g 800 12 22,930 g 2201,280.00
Yard Trash $ 227 12 22,930 ¢ 624,613.20
Bulk Yard Debris $ 3.65 12 02,930 ¢ 1,554,654

8,448,372.00

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $

Company Name: Coastal Waste & Recycling, Inc.
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OPTION 2

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week

2 Times per week

3 Times per week

Small Commercial

75.00 i
(cart service) $ A A
2 yarq‘l frontload § 85.32 $ 170.64 $ 255.96
container
4 yarcj frontload $ 170.64 $ 341.28 $ 511.92
container
6 yard frontload $ 255.96 $ 511.92 $ 767.89
container
8 yarc.l frontload ¢ 341.28 ¢ 682.57 ¢ 1023.85
container

Company Name: Coastal Waste & Recycling, Inc.
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COUNTY SERVICES

Cost per pickup X Pickup(s) per Week X Weeks of Service = Extended Cost

Location Name Location Address C-ontamer/Cart Cost per pickup Pickup(s) Weel.{s of Extended Cost
Size per week | Service

Animal Enforcement CR.25A Frontload 8 yd. | § 78.82 1 52 s 4098.55
Animal Shelter 1392 NW Shelter Gln. Frontload8yd. |$ 78.82 2 52 $ 8197.09
Annie Mattox Park 537 NE Center Ave Frontload 8yd. | $ 78.82 1 52 s 4098.55
Bethlehem Community Center 835 SE Bethlehem Ave. Frontload 8yd. | $ 78.82 1 52 $  4098.55
Columbia County Emergency | »¢3 \ryy 1 ake City Ave. Frontload 6 yd. | $ 59.11 2 52 s 6147.82
Operations Center
Columbia County Offices 180 E Duval St Frontload 6yd $ 59.11 1 52 s 307391
Columbia County Fire Station | 508 SW State Road 247 Frontload 4yd. | $ 39.41 1 52 5 2049.27
Columbia County Fire Station | 7564 NW US Highway 41 96 gal Cart s 1732 1 52 s 900.69
Columbia County Fire Stafon | 2315 SW Pinemount Hwy. 96 gal Cart s 1732 1 52 s 900.69
Columbia County Fire SO | 12595 5 US Highway 441 96 gal Cart s 17.32 1 52 $  900.69
Columbia County Fire S@HOR | 495 SW Dortoh St Frontload2yd. | § 19-70 1 52 5 1024.64
Columbia County Fire Station | 370 SE Race Track Ln. Frontload 4yd. |$  39.41 1 52 5 204927
Columbia County Fire Stfion | 1456 W Mershon St. %galCart  |§ 17.32 1 52 S 900.69

#50
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Location Name Location Address gi;:tainer/Cart Cost per pickup gzk;i’g{) ;Zf:li{cse()f Extended Cost
Columbia County Fire Station | 579 NW Lake Jeffery Rd. 96galCart | $ 17:32 1 52 §  900.69
gl‘,’alﬁfl’lbia County Library West | 435\t Hall of Fame Dr. Frontload4yd. |$ 39.41 1 52 s 204927
Columbia County Main Library | 308 NW Columbia Ave. Frontload2yd. | § 19.70 1 52 $ 1024.64
g‘;}l‘fgbia‘ County Sheriff’s 4917 E US Highway 90 Frontload 6yd. | § 59.11 1 52 s 307391
gﬁitzlgﬁbcsotiilitgfheriff’s 347 Business Point Dr. Frontload2yd. | $ 19.70 1 52 $ 1024.64
Courthouse Annex 135 NE Hernando Ave. Frontload 8yd. |$ 78.82 5 52 $ 20492.73
Deep Creek Community Center | 11934 N US Highway 441 Frontload2yd. |$ 17.32 1 52 $ 1024.64
g:g;g;bia County Detention 389 NW Quinten St. Frontload8yd. |$  78.82 5 52 $  20492.73
Guardian ad Litem 885 SW Sister Welcome Rd. Frontload2yd. |$ 19.70 1 52 $  1024.64
Lulu Community Center 205 SW Community Ct. Frontload4yd. | $ 39.41 1 52 $ 2049.27
Mason City Community Center | 11110 S US Highway 441 Frontload4yd. | $§ 39.41 1 52 $ 209.27
RC Track 1516 NW Bascom Norris Dr. Frontload 8yd. |$ 78.82 1 52 $ 4098.55
Richardson Community Center | 255 NE Coach Anders Ln. Frontload2yd. | $ 19.70 1 52 $ 1024.64
Rum Tsland Park 1614 SW Rum Island Terr. Frontload 8yd. |$ 7/8-82 1 52 g  4098.55
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Location Name Location Address C.ontainer/Cart Cost per pickup Pickup(s) Weel.\’s of Extended Cost
Size per week | Service
(S:"“th Columbia Ft. White 17579 SW SR 47 Fronfload4yd. |§ 3941 1 52 s 204927
ommunity Center
Springville Community Center 3710 NW Suwannee Valley Rd. Frontload4yd. | $ 39.41 1 52 $ 2049.27
Supervisors of Elections 1701 E Duval St. Frontload2yd. | $ 19.70 1 52 g 1024.64
Watertown Lake 622 NE Williams St. Frontload2yd. |$ 19.70 1 52 s 1024.64
Westside Community Center 431 SW Birley Ave. Frontload4yd. |$ 3941 1 52 $ 204927
Winfield Community Center and | ;307 \wy winfield St. Fronfload 4yd. | § 39-41 1 52 s 204927
Recreational Area
Total County Services $ 113,114.94
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